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14,
TCWN BOARD MEETING
Town Hall 3/371 8:00 PM
Present: Councilmen Niehaus, Bolander, D'Antoni, Supervisor Vines
Town Attorney
Deputy Town Attorney
Town Clerk Absent: Councilman Frohling

Supervisor Vines called Town Board meeting to order; assemblage
salutecd the flag.

(1971-126) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that minutes of Town Board meetings and Public Hearings
held in the month of February 1971 are hereby approved and accepted as
submitted by the Town Clerk.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander. : All voted Aye.

(1971-127) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that time for receiving bids for Transportation for Senior
Citizens is closed, and be it

FURTHER RESOLVED, that any and all bids received be opened.

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

The following bid was received:

ROCKLAND BUS LINES, INC.
Raute 9W, Congers, New York

1. Congers Senior CitizensSceeseceseces$32.50
2. Nanuet Senior CitizenS...ccccececcesse 37.50
3. New City Senior CitizenS.ceecececscec._37.50

mTAL pER WEH(.-o....oo..o.’-.-......003107.50
i~ -3
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(1971-128) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that decision on award of bid for Transportation for Senior

Citizens be reserved.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander.

All voted Aye.

(1671-129) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED that time for receiving bids for Baseball Egquipment

is closed, and be it

FURTHER RESOLVED, that any and all bids received up to and including

this time be opened.

Seconded by Councilman D’Antoni.

The following bids were received:

(SEE SEPARATE SHEET- ATTACHED)

All voted Aye.
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TODD PHELPS SPIG.
CHAMPION PFRODUCTS
S.F. GOLDSTEIN

FREDDIES SPORT SHOP

BIDS -~ BASEBALL EQUIPMENT - 1971

SEA-LAWN PRODUCTS CQ|NO BID

ATS Co.
MARTY SPOLAN

VMORLEY ATHLETIC
SUPPLY CO.

SIMKIN'S INC.

FRED SALES

tem #1
Item #2
Item #3
Ttem #4
Item #5
Item #
Item #7
Item #8
Item #9

{tem #10
Ttem #11
Item #12

e

ITEM DESCRIPTION

-
-
-
-
-
-
-
-
-

-

Baseballs
Baseball Bats
Batting Helmets
Catcher's Mitts
Chest Protectors
Duffle Bags '
Homcplates
Scorebooks

Shin Guards
T-Shirts

Hats

Softballs

ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 T?r:rl;q 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 2 ITEM 8 _ITEM 9§ ITEM 10 ITEM 11 ITEM ]2

$1092.87  {82L49.00 $239.60 | $78.90 $52.90 $97.20 | $114.60 | 876.00 $53.40 $1104.83 |$915.60 | 3355.40

iNO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID | NO BID oBID |No BID “ NO BID NO BID -{$1580.24 |NO BID |:iO BID

81163.14  [8287.64 $259.56 850.30 ~ |864.80 Eo BID ‘3 NO BID $127.84 $56.94 NO BID  |NO BID | 1239.94

81369.35 |$369.60 8206.40  [887.12 $66.00 $118.80 | NO BID ] $124.48 | $50.16 NO BID  |NO BID |.l0 BID
NO BID NO BID Ko BID ' $66.00 $127.44 | NO BID | NO BID ‘ $66.00 $1145.54 |NO BID ] '10 BID

NO BID NO BID $276.00 NO BID NO BID $108.00 [8245.75 : 913'6..00 ""$57.00 NO BID 953.75 | 10 BID

$1191.65 (8276.00  [g2u3,30 [89B.00 472,00 o BID  $111.85 3886.#0 j $59.20 | 81362.58 fok1.76 [8261.60

- s

$1971.50  {$288.00 $240.00  [896.00 $60.00 8148.00 | 128.50 $120.00 | $60.00 815_78.56 1090.00 | §300.00

$1190.32  |$285.60 §259.20 |892.80  |865.88 $10.70 [B114.95 |$120.00 | $53.76 $1243.81 £938.u9 1245.10
i ' '

81143.40 INo B> NO BID  [NO BID  {NO BID lpo BID |NOBID {NO BID | ~|NO BID NO BID Blzdzzx: 8253, 20

remaT oy
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(1971-130) Councilman Bolander offered the following resolution:

REGOLVEDR, that award for furnishing of Baseball Eyuipment be
reserved.,

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

(1971-131) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESQEVED, ,that time for receiving bids for the furnishing of
Air Compressor is closed, and be it

FURTHER RESOLVED, that any and all bids received up to and
including this time be opened.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander. . All voted Aye.

The following bids were received:

A UNITED RENT-ALLS OF WHITE PLAINS, INC.
19-21 Russell St., White Plains, New York

TOTAL COSTecececcocccssesee$3291.75

HIGH TOR CONTRACTORS SALES, INC.
3 Dogwood Lane, West Nyack N Y

TOTAIJ COST.o..o.ooo0-0000082997072

I-R EQUIPMENT CORPORATION
98 Route #10, East Hanover, N.J.

TOTAL COST.oo-oo-ooo.ooo-oOS}OSB-M

(1971-132) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:
decision.on” = .i l.c., ' '
RESOLVED that/award of bid for furnishing One - Air Compressor’
be reserved.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.
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(1971-133) Councilman Nichaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that the application of LONE STAR PROPERTIES, Iic.
for a change of zoning from an LIO & R-h0 District to an R3G-2 District, on
property located on the easterly side of Route 3C35, Valley Cottage, Town of
Clarkstown, be referred to the Town Planning Board for report pursuant to
the provisions of Secs. 8.41, 8.42 and 8.421 of the Clarkstown Building Zone
Crdinance and to the Rockland County Planning Board pursuant to 3ecs. 239-1
and 239-m of the General Municipal Law.

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

(1971-134) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resclution:

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is authorized to advertise for
bids for the construction of a swimming pool and bathhouse complex at the
Traphagen site; said bids to be returnable on March 22nd, 1371 at 3:00 PM;
specifications for same available at the office of the Town Clerk, 10 Maple
Avenue, lew City, New York. : .

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

Leeman,

Mr. Stephen{ representing RENOWMI suggested that re’erendum
should be held in connection with construction of swimming pool and bathhouse
conplex. Mr, Steinberg, Suffern, New York, attorney representing Mr. Leeman
stated that location of pool moved; if pool on later acquired proverty, there
should be referendum. Mr. Ghiazza, Supt. of Parks & Recreation, stated only
portion is expansion of parking lot;where pool is now is on original acreage.
In this same connection, Mr. Malten appeared before the Town Board requesting
meeting before going ahead with construction, Mr. Fred Hager of Valley Cottage
concurring. Mr. Zollendeck, Town Planner state this site recommended by Planning
Board; in terms of planning this is best location for this pool.

(1971-135) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:
WHEREAS, the State of New York, in its desire to cooperate in

assisting municipal narcotics guidance council programs, has made available
a limited amount of funds, and

‘(cont)

W
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(1971-135 - cont)

WHEREAS, in order to obtain reimbursement for certain expenses
from the State of New York, it is necessary to execute an agreement between
the municipality and the State Narcotics Addiction Control Commission;

NOW THEREFORE, be it

RESOLVED, that the Supervisor of the Town of Clarkstown is
hereby authorized to execute said agreement and to take such other action
as is necessary to effectuate the program of the Clarkstown Narcotics Guidance
Council.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.

(1971-136) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that Bond No. NF-3875523-A issued by Hartford Accident
& Indemnity Company, Hartford Plaza, Hartford, Conn. to Emil J. Pederson,
185 So. Western Highway, Blauvelt, New York, covering sewer hook-up work
in the Town of Clarkstown, be declared in default, and be it

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Attorney of the Town of
Clarkstown be directed to take all necessary proceedings against said
bond to insure that all of the obligations under said vond are complied with.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander. All voted Aye.

Letter received from Central School District No. 1, Charles A.
Klothe, District Clerk re sidewalk priorities. Town Clerk will forward copy
of same to Highway Superintendent and Planning Board.

Letter received from Clarkstown Planning Board, Frank R. Steffens,
Chairman, re Michael Guarino, New City, Subdivision. Town Clerk will forward
copy of same to members of the Town Board. '
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(1971-137) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESQOLVED, that Frank W. Foley and Harold E. Aber are hereby
authorized to attend a 10 week seminar on the Assessment Improvement law
being conducted at Rockland Community College, with the fee of $20.00 per
person made a proper Town Charge.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander. All voted Aye.

(1971~138) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

WHEREAS, it has become necessary to establish a petty cash
fund in the office of the Narcotics Council for the purpose of paying
incidental miror expenses in connection with its affairs;

NOW THEREFORE, be it

RESOLVED, that a petty cash fund is hereby established,
pursuant to section 64-1 (A) of the Town Law, for the office of the

Marcotics Council, in the amount of $25.00.

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

(1971-139) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby authorized to advertise
for bids for cleaning and maintenance of the Town Highway Garage; said bids
to be returnable on 4/7/71 - 8:07 PM.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.

(1971-140) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby authorized to advertise
for bids for cleaning and maintenance of the Town Hall, including the Police
Department; said bids to be returnable on 4/7/71 - 8:09 PM.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.
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(1971-141) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby authorized to
advertise for bids for cleaning and maintenance of the Clarkstown
Community Center, Central Nyack; said bids to be returnable on 4/7/71 -
8:12 PM.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.

(1971-142) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby authorized to advertise
for bids for the renovatinn of the Clarkstown Town Highway Annex into office
space; said bids to be returnable on 4/7/71 - 8:15 PM.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander. All voted Aye.

(1971-143) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

WHEREAS, a lease presently exists between New City Properties
and the Town of Clarkstown for office space occupied by the Building iInspector's
Office at 151 South Main St., New City N Y, and

WHEREAS, it has been determined that the Building Inspector's
Office can best serve the Townof Clarkstown by being located in town-owned
facilities, and

WHEREAS, the location of the Building Inspector's Office in
Town owned facilities will save the town a substantial amount of rent;

NOW THEREFORE, be it

RESOLVED, that the Town Attorney's Office be instructed to
notify New City Properties that the lease dated 4/1/70 covering office space
now being occupied by the Building Inspector's Office at 151 South Main St.,
New Citly N Y will not be renewed.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.



TBY - 3/3/ 71

Paze &

(1971-144) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that parking be restricted on the north side of
Scott Dr., New City; 200' in both east and west direction from intersection
of Jeff Lane, and be it

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Highway Superintendent be directed
fo install necessary "NO PARKING" signs, as recommended by the Clarkstown
Police Chief and the Clarkstown Traffic Advisory Council.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander. All voted Aye.

Proposed resolution authorizing Highway Supt. to erect traffic
light at intersection of College Ave. and Frist St., Nanuet -~ tabled.

(1971-145) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that a "STOP" sign be installed by the Highway Supt.
on the southeast corner of Fairview Avenue, Nanuet where it intersects with
Prospect Avenue, Nanuet; as recommended by the Clarkstown Traffic Advisory
Committee.

Seconded by Councilman Niechaus. All voted Aye.

Town Board signed ORDER calling public hearing in the matter
of petition for the proposed extension of the Clarkstown Consolidated wWater
Supply District #1 to include area in the vicinity of Pascack Road, Nanuet N Y--
4/7/71 - 8:30 PM.

Proposed resolution accepting Sewer Easement - District 34B -
Starr, Gail W. --- tabled until 3/17/71 TBM.

1970 Census of Population for Clarkstown received from Theodore
E. Zollendeck, Town Planner. Town Clerk will forward copy to each member of the
Town Board.
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RESOLUTION DETERMINING THE TERMS, FORM AND DETAILS
OT' ISSUANCE OF $12, 670, 000 VARIOUS SEWER DISTRICTS AND GENERAL
PURPOSES SERIAL BONDS-1971 OF THE TOWN OF CLARKSTOWN, IN THE |
COUNTY OF ROCKLAND, NEW YORK, AND PROVIDING FOR THEIR SALE.

Recitals

WHEREAS, the Town of Clarkstown (herein called "Town"), in the
County of Rockland, New York, has heretofore duly authorized, sold and
issued its bond anticipation notes in the aggregate principal amount of
$14, 109, 160 in anticipation of the sale of the $13,867, 597. 41 unredeemed
balances of' aggregate authorizations of $14, 833, 378. 41 serial bonds hereto-
fore duly authorized for various sewer districts and other general purposes
improvements, as hereinafter more fully described, and said bond anticipa-
tions notes have been renewed and portions thereof have been redeemed and
redemption thereof provided therefor from sources other than the proceeds
of said bonds, from time to time, all pursuant to the provisions of the Local l
Finance Law, constituting Chapter 33-a of the Consolidated Laws of the
State of New York (herein called "Law''); and

WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town now deems it to be in the
public interest and desirable to proceed with the sale and issuance of said
serial bonds or portions thereof, to the extent that payment of said bond
anticipation notes from sources other than the proceeds of said bonds has
not been heretofore made or provided for, pursuant to the Law;
now, therefore, be it

RESOLVED BY THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF CLARKS-
TOWN, IN THE COUNTY OF ROCKLAND, NEW YORK, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Of the $258, 884. 75 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:

""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted December
13, 1965 and amendcd April 30, 1969, appropriating $258, 884. 75 for the
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construction of a lateral sewer system in Extension No. 6 of Sewer District
No. 8, in the Town of Clarkstown and authorizing the issuance of $258, 884. 75
serial bonds of said Town to finance said appropriation, "
duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred to,
$191, 000 serial bonds shall be issued, being part of the $242, 884. 75 unre-
deemed balance of said bonds, bond anticipation notes in the principal amount
of $207, 000 having been heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said
bonds and redemption thereof provided therefor to the extent of $16, 000 from
a source other than the proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the
principal amount of $4, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1976,
inclusive, $5, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1977 to 1985, inclusive,
and $6, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1986 to 2006, inclusive.
Section 2. Of the $526, 260 serial bonds of the Town, authorized pur-
suant to the bond resolution, entitled:
"Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted September
25, 1961, authorizing the construction of a sewer system in New City Sewer
District of the Town of Clarkstown, stating the estimated maximum cost
thereof is $526, 260, appropriating said amount therefor and authorizing the

issuance of $526, 260 serial bonds of said Town to finance the appropriation, "
[Sewer District No. 10]

duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $420, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being part of the $421, 260 unredeemed balance
of said bonds, bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $525, 000
héving been heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and
redemption thereof provided therefor to the extent of $105, 000 from a source
other than the proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal
amount of $15, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1975, inclusive,
and $20, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1976 to 1993, inclusive.

Section 3. Of the $2, 150, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:

"Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted May 24,
1965 and amended June 18, 1969, authorizing $2, 150, 000 for the construction



of a lateral sewer system in Sewer District No. 16, in the Town of Clarks-
town and authorizing the issuance of $2, 150, 000 serial bonds of said Town
to finance said appropriation, "

duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred
to, $1, 320, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein desig-
nated ''Series A'"), being the unredeemed balance of said Series Af bond
anticipation notes in the principal amount of $1, 426, 000 having been hereto-
fore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $106, 000 from a source other than the
proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $35, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1995, inclusive, and $40, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1996 to 2007, inclusive.

Section 4. Of said $2, 150, 000 serial bi)nds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, as amended, hereinabove cited in Section
3 hereof, $352, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein
designated '""Series B''), being the unredeemed balance of said Series B,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $360, 000 having been
heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption
thereof provided therefor to the extent of $8, 000 from a source other than
the proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of
$8, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1980, inclusive, $10, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 1981 to 1984, inclusive, $11, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1985 to 2002, inclusive, $12, 000 on
February 1, 2003 and $10, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 2004 to.:'
2006. After giving effect td the issuance of said Series A and said Series
B bonds, hereinabove referred to in Section 3 and this Section 4, an

amount of $364, 000 will remain authorized and unissued of said $2, 150, 000

bonds.



Section 5. Of the 81, 476, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized

pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:

"Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted September
14, 1964 and amended June 18, 1969, authorizing $1, 475, 000 for the con-
struction of a lateral sewer system in Sewer District No. 17, in the Town of
Clarkstown and authorizing the issuance of $1, 475, 000 serial bonds of said
Town to finance said appropriation, "

duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred to,
$764, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein designated
""Series A'"), being the unredeemed balance of said Series A, bond anticipa-
tion notes in the principal amount of $828, 000 having been heretofore issued
in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof provided
therefor to the extent of $64, 000 from a source other than the proceeds of
said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $18, 000 on February
1, 1972, $17, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1973 to 1977, inclusive,
$22, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1978 to 1980, inclusive, $20, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 1981 to 1984, inclusive, $24, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1985 to 2002, inclusive, $23, 000 on
February 1, 2003 and $20, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 2004 to
2006, inclusive. After giving effect to the issuance of said Series A bonds,
there will remain a $633, 000 unredeemed balance of said $1, 475, 000 bonds,
additional bond anticipation notes aggregating $485, 000 having been hereto-
fore issued and redemption thereof provided therefor to the extent of $14, 000
from a source other than the proceeds of said bonds.

Section 6. Of the $1, 695, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:
'""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted March 8,
1965, amended on June 19, 1968 and further amended on December 22, 1969,
authorizing $1, 695, 000 for the construction of a lateral sewer system in
Sewer District No. 20, in said.Town and authorizing the issuance of

$1, 695, 000 serial bonds of said Town to finance said appropriation, "

duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred to,
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$980, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (hcretofqrc and herein designated
"Series A"), being the unredeemed balance of said Series A, bond anticipa-
tion notes in the principal amount of $1, 058, 000 having been heretofore
issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof pro-
vided therefor to the extent of $78, 000 from a source other than the bro-—
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $25, 000 on
February 1, 1972, $24, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1973 to 1977,
inclusive, $25, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1978 to 1991, inclu-
sive, $30, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1992 to 2002, inclusive,
$31, 500 on February 1 in each of the years 2003 to 2005, inclusive, $30, 500
on February 1, 2006 and $30, 000 on February 1, 2007.

Section 7. Of said $1, 695, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, as amended, hereinabove cited in Section 6
hereof, $468, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein desig-
nated ""Series B'), being the unredeemed balance of said Series B, bond
anticipation notes in the principal amount of $492, 000 having been heretofore
issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof pro-
vided therefor to the extent of $24, 000 from a source other than the proceeds
of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $10, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1988, inclusive, $14, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1989 and 1990 and $15, 000 on February 1 in
each of the years 1991 to 2008, inclusive.

Section 8. ‘ Of said $1, 695, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resélution, as amended, hereinabove cited in Section 6
hereof, $145, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein desig-
nated ''Series é") and shall mature in the principal amount of $3, 000 on
February 1 in each of the year's. 1972 to 1974, inclusive, and $4, 000 on

February 1 in each of the years 1975 to 2008, inclusive.



Section 9. Of the $828, 060 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:
"Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted August 4,
1965, appropriating $828, 000 for the construction of a lateral sewer system
in Sewer District No. 21 in the Town of Clarkstown and authorizing the issu-
ance of $828, 000 serial bonds of said Town to finance said appropriation, "
* and amended July 3, 1968,
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $770, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $828, 000 having been
heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption
thereof provided therefor to the extent of $58, 000 from a source other than
the proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of
$20, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1977, inclusive, $19, 000
on February 1, 1978, $20, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1979 to
1994, inclusive, $19, 000 on February 1, 1995, $20, 000 on February 1,

1996, $19, 000 on February 1, 1997, $22, 000 on February 1, 1998, $23, 000

on February 1, 1999, $25, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 2000 to

2002, inclusive, $27, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 2003 to 20086,
inclusive, and $25, 000 on February 1, 2007.

Sectionv 10. Of the $1, 325, 000 serial ‘bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled: |
"Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown; New York, adopted August 4,
1965 and amended November 26, 1969, authorizing $1, 325, 000 for the con-

struction of a lateral sewer system in Sewer District No. 22, in the Town
of Clarkstovm and authorizing the 1ssuance of $1, 325, 000 serial bonds of

 said Town to finance said appropriation, "

duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred

to, $744, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein designated
"Series A"), being the unredeemed balance of said Series A, bond anticipa-
tion notes in the principal amount of $780, 000 having been heretofore issued

in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof provided
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therefor tothe cxtent of $36, 000 from a source other than the proceeds of
said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $19, 750 on
February 1, 1972, $18, 250 on February 1, 1973, $17,500 on February 1,
1974, $18,500 on February 1 in each of the ycars 1975 to 1982, inclusive,
$19, 500 on February 1, 1983, $20, 500 on February 1 in each of the years
1984 and 1985, $21, 500 on February 1 in each of the years 1986 to 1988,
inclusive, $18,500 on February 1, 1989, $18, 000 on February 1, 1990,
$21, 500 on February 1 in each of the years 1991 to 1993, inclusive,

$20, 500 on February 1, 1994, $18,500 on February 1, 1995, $21, 500 on
February 1, 1996, $18,500 on February 1, 1997, $20, 500 on February 1,
1998, $20, 000 on February 1, 1999, $21, 000 on February 1 in each of the
years 2000 to 2002, $22,500 on February 1 in each of the years 2003 to
2006, inclusive, and $21, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 2007 and
2008.

Section 11, Of said $1, 325, 000 serial bonds of the Town, author-

~ ized pursuant to the bond resolution, as amended, hereinabove cited in

Section 10 hereof, $535, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and
herein designated "Series B''), being the unredeemed balance of said
Series B, bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $545, 000
having been heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and
redemption thereof provided therefor to the extent of $10, 000 from a source
other than the proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal
amount of $10, 000 on February 1, 1972, $12,500 on February 1, 1973,
$11,500 on February 1, .1974, $12,500 on February 1, 1975, $11, 500 on
February 1, 1976, $14, 000 on February 1, 1977, $13, 000 on February 1,
1978 and $15, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1979 to 2008, inclu-

sive.



Section 12. Of the $940,000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized

pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:
""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted August 4,
1965, amended on November 20, 1968 and further amended on February 4,
1970, authorizing $940, 000 for the construction of a lateral sewer system
in Sewer District No. 23, in said Town and authorizing the issuance of
$940, 000 serial bonds of said Town to finance said appropriation, "
duly adopted and amended by the Town Boa: d on the dates therein referred
to, $510, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein designated
"'Series A'"), being the unredeemed balance of said Series A, bond anticipa-
tion notes in the principal amount of $535, 000 having been heretofore issued
in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof provided
therefor to the extent of $25, 000 from a source other than the proceeds of
said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $12, 000 on February
1, 1972, $10, 000 on Fébruary 1 in each of the years 1973 to 1980, inclusive,
$15, 000 on February 1, 1981, $13, 000 on February 1, 1982 and $15, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1983 to 2008, inclusive.

Section 13. Of said $940, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, as amended, hereinabove cited in Section
12 hereof, $171, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein
designated ''Series B'"), being the unredeemed balance of said Series B,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $175, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $4, 000 from a source other than the pro-
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in 1;he principal amount of $4, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1988, inclusive, $5, 000 on February
1 in each of the years 1989 to 2005, inclusive, and $6, 000 on February 1 in
each of the years 2006 to 2008, inclusive.

Section 14. Of said $940, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized

pursuant to the bond resolution, as amended, hereinabove cited in Section



12 hereof, $230, 000 scrial bond;‘, shall be issued (heretofore and herein
designated ""Series C'") and shall mature in the principal amount of $5, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1981, inclusive, $6,000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1982 to 1990, inclusive, and $7, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1991 to 2008, inclusive.

Section 15, Of the $168, 000 serial bonds of the Town, aut‘horized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:
""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted August 4,
1965, appropriating $168, 000 for the construction of a lateral sewer system
in Sewer District No. 24 in the Town of Clarkstown and authorizing the issu-
ance of $168, 000 serial bonds of said Town to finance said appropriation, "
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $156, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $168, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $12, 000 from a source other than the pro- l
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $4, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1995, ‘inclusive, and $5, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1996 to 2007, inclusive.

Seci:ion 16. Of the $500, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:
""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted May 15,
1968, appropriating $500, 000 for the construction of a lateral sewer system
in Extension No. 1 of Sewer District No. 24, in the Town of Clarkstown and
authorizing the issuance of $500, 000 serial bonds of said Town to finance
said appropriation, "
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $476, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $500, 000 having been

heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption

thereof provided therefor to the extent of $24, 000 from a source other than
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the proceeds of said bonds, and’shall mature in the principal amount of

$10, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1985, inclusive, $12, 000
on February 1 in cach of the years 1986 to 1983, inclusive, and $15, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1989 to 2008, inclusive.

Section 17. Of the 81, 400, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:

'""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted June 15,
1966 and amended December 22, 1969, appropriating $1, 400, 000 for the
construction of a lateral sewer system in Sewer District No. 26, in the

Town of Clarkstown and authorizing the issuance of $1, 400, 000 serial

bonds of said Town to finance said appropriation, "

duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred
to, $1, 042, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and herein desig-
nated ''Series A'), being the unredeemed balance of said Series A, bond
anticipation notes in the principal amount of $1, 092, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $50, 000 from a source other than the pro-
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $20, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1975, inclusive, $25, 000 on February
1 in each of the years 1976 to 1978, inclusive, $27, 000 on February 1 in each
of the years 1979 to 1982, inclusive, $29, 000 on February 1, 1983 and

$30, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1984 to 2008, inclusive.

Section 18. Of said $1, 400, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, as amended, hereinabove cited in Section 17
hereof, $308, 000 serial bonds shall be issued (heretofore and and herein
designated "Series B'") and shall mature in the principal amount of $6, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1976, inclusive, $7, 000 on
February 1, 1977, $8, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1978 to 1985,

inclusive, and $9, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1986 to 2008,

inclusive.



Section 19. Of the $705, 073. 66 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:
"Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted June 15,
1966 and amended March 31, 1969, authorizing $705, 073. 66 for the con-
struction of a lateral sewer system in Sewer District No. 27, in the Town
of Clarkstown and authorizing the issuance of $705, 073. 66 serial bonds of
said Town to finance said appropriation, "
duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred
to, $530, 000 serial bonds shall be issued, being part of the $675, 073. 66 un-
redeemed balance of said bonds, bond anticipation notes in the principal
amqunt of $560, 000 having been heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale
of said bonds and redemption thereof provided therefor to the extent of
$30, 000 from a source other than the proceeds of said bonds, and shall m;-
ture in the principal amount of $10, 000 on FeBiuary 1 in each of the years
1972 and 1973 and $15, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1974 to 2007,
inclusive.

Section 20. Of the $943, 800 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond resolution, entitled:
""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted June 15,
1966, appropriating $943, 800 for the construction of a lateral sewer system
in Sewer District No. 28 in the Town of Clarkstown and authorizing the issu-
ance of $943, 800 serial bonds of said Town to finance said appropriation, "
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $897, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $943, 800 having been
heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption
thereof provided therefoz; to the extent of $46, 800 from a source other than
the procceds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of
$20, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1985, inclusive, $25, 000

on February 1 in each of the years 1986 to 1994, inclusive, and $28, 000 on

February 1 in cach of the years 1995 to 2008, inclusive.
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Section 21, Of the $80, 000 scrial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond and capital note resolution, entitled:
"Bond and Capital Note Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York,
adopted August 3, 1966, authorizing the acquisition of certain land situate
on the northeasterly corner of the intersection of Maple Avenue and Dema-
rest Avenue, in New City, in said Town, as an addition to the site of the
Town Hall, at an ¢stimated maximum cost of $85, 000, appropriating said
amount therefor, and authorizing the issuance of $5, 000 capital notes to
provide the down payment and $80, 000 serial bonds to finance the balance
of said appropriation, " '
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $68, 500
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $80, 000 having been
heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption
thereof provided therefor to the extent of $11, 500 from a source other than
the proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of
$3, 000 on February 1, 1972, $2,500 on February 1, 1973, $3, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1974 to 1990, inclusive, and $2, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1991 to 1996, inclusive.

Section 22, Of the $137, 750 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond and capital note resolution, entitled:
"Bond and Capital Note Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York,
adopted June 19, 1968, authorizing the acquisition of certain land bordering
on Route 304, Congers Road and Demarest Avenue, in New City, in said
Town, as an addition to the site of the Town Hall, at an estimated maximum
cost of $145, 000, appropriating said amount therefor, and authorizing the
issuance of $7,250 capital notes to provide the down payment and $137, 750
serial bonds to finance the balance of said appropriation, "
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date thercin referred to, $129, 500
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $137, 750 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $8, 250 from a source other than the pro-

cecds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $3, 750 on

February 1 in each of the years 1972 and 1973, $4, 000 on February 1 in



each of the years 1974 to 1976, inclusive, $4, 500 on February 1 in each of
the years 1977 to 1984, inclusive, $5, 000 on February 1 in each of the years
1985 to 1990, inclusive, and $5, 500 on February 1 in each of the years 1991
to 1998, inclusive.

Section 23. Of the $90, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond and capital note resolution (1), entitled:

""Bond and Capital Note Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York,
adopted July 6, 1966, authorizing (1) acquisition of certain land situate on
the northerly side of Demarest Mill Road near its intersection with West
Nyack Road, in Nanuet, in said Town, as the site of a Town highway
garage, at an estimated maximum cost of $95, 000, appropriating said
amount therefor, and authorizing the issuance of $5, 000 capital notes to
provide the down payment and $90, 000 serial bonds to finance the balance
of said appropriation and (2) the construction of a Town highway garage on
said site, stating the estimated maximum cost thereof is $485, 000, appro-
priating said amount therefor and authorizing the issuance of $25, 000
capital notes to provide the down payment and $460, 000 serial bonds of

said Town to finance the balance of said appropriation and stating the
estimated total cost of said acquisition and construction is $580, 000, "

duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $78, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds.
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $90, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $12, 000 from a source other than the pro-
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $3, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1993, inclusive, and $4, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1994 to 1996, inclusive.

Section 24. Of the $460, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized
pursuant to the bond and capital note resolution (2), hereinabove cited in
Section 23 hereof, $415, 000 serial bonds shall be issued, being the unre-
deemed balance of said bonds, boad anticipation notes in the principal
amount of $460, 000 having been heretofore issued in anticipation of the

éale of said bonds and redemption thereof provided therefor to the extent

of $45, 000 from a source other than the proceeds of said bonds, and shall
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mature in the principal amount 6f $15, 000 on Fcbruary 1 in each of the years
1972 to 1992, inclusive, and $20, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1993
to 1997, inclusive.

Section 25. Of the $110, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized opur-
suant to the bond resolution, entitled:
""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted June 15,
1966, authorizing construction and installation of surface drainage sewer
facilities and appurtenances thereto in parts of said Town, stating the
‘estimated maximum cost of said class of objects or purposes is $110, 000,
appropriating said amount therefor and authorizing the issuance of
$110, 000 serial bonds to finance said appropriation, " [Project No. 1}
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $85, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $110, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $25, 000 from a source other than the pro-
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $7, 000 on
February 1, 1972, $8, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1973 to 1975,
inclusive, and $9, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1976 to 1981, inclu-
sive.

Section 26, Of the $221, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized pur-
suant to the bond resolution, entitled:
""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted October 5,
1966, authorizing construction and installation of surface drainage sewer
facilities and appurtenances thereto in parts of said Town, stating the
estimated maximum cost of said class of objects or purposes is $221, 000,
appropriating said amount therefor and authorizing the issuance of
$221, 000 serial bonds to finance said appropriation, " [Project No. 2]
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $160, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $221, 000 having been here-

tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof

provided therefor to the extent of $61, 000 from a source other than the
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proceeds of.said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $15, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1979, inclusive, and $20, 000 on
February 1 in each of the years 1980 and 1981.

Section 27. Of the $145, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized pur-
suant to the bond resolution, entitled:
'""Bond Resoclution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted June 21,
1967, authorizing construction and installation of surface drainage sewer
facilities and appurtenances thereto in parts of said Town, stating the.
estimated maximum cost of said class of objects or purposes is $145, 000,
appropriating said amount therefor and authorizing the issuance of
$145, 000 serial bonds to finance said appropriation, " [Project No. 3}
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $110, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $145, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $35, 000 from a source other than the pro-
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $10, 000 l
on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1982, inclusive.

Section 28. Of the $275, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized pur-
suant to the bond resolution, entitled:

-

""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted August 21,
1968, authorizing construction and installation of surface drainage sewer
facilities and appurtenances thereto in said Town, stating the estimated
maximum cost of said class of objects or purposes is $275, 000, appropri-
ating said amount therefor and authorizing the issuance of $275, 000 serial
bonds to finance said appropriation, " [Project No. 4]

duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $237, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $275, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $38, 000 from a source other than the pro-

ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $15, 000 on

February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1974, inclusive, $20, 000 on
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February 1 in each of the years 1975 to 1977, inclusive, and $22, 000 on
February 1 in cach of the years 1978 to 1983, inclusive.
Section 29. Of the $220, 00_0 serial bonds of the Town, authorized pur-
suant to the bond resolution, entitled:
'""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted May 21,
1969, authorizing construction and installation of surface drainage sewer
facilities and appurtenances thereto in said Town, stating the estimated
maximum cost of said class of objects or purposes is $220, 000, appropri-
ating said amount therefor and authorizing the issuance of $220, 000 serial
bonds to finance said appropriation, " [Project No. 5]
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $208, 000
serial bonds shall be issued, being the unredeemed balance of said bonds,
bond anticipation notes in the principal amount of $220, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof
provided therefor to the extent of $12, 000 from a source other than the pro-
ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $12, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 1972 and 1973, $13, 000 on February 1,
1974, $15, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1975 to 1977, inclusive,
and $18, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1978 to 1984, inclusive.
Section 30. Of the $100, 000 serial bonds of the Town, authorized pur-
suant to the bond resolution, entitled:
'""Bond Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York, adopted August 6,
1969, authorizing construction and installation of surface drainage sewer
facilities and appurtenances thereto in said Town, stating the estimated
maximum cost of said class of objects or purposes is $100, 000, appropri-
ating said amount therefor and authorxzmg the issuance of $100, 000 serial
bonds to finance said appropriation, '' [Project No. 6]
duly adopted by the Town Board on the date therein referred to, $95, 000
serial bonds shall be 1ssued being the unredeenied balance of said bonds,
bond antlc1pat10n notes in the principal amount of $100, 000 having been here-
tofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said bonds and redemption thereof

provided therefor to the extent of $5, 000 from a source other than the pro-

ceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the principal amount of $5, 000 on
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February 1,. 1972 and $7, 500 on February 1 in each of the years 1973 to 1984,
inclusive.

Section 31. Of the $79, 610 serial bonds of the Town, authorized pur-
suant to the bond and capital note resolution (1), entitled:
""Bond and Capital Note Resolution of the Town of Clarkstown, New York,
adopted August 21, 1968, and amended October 7, 1970, authorizing as
part of Stage 1 of the Valley Cottage Hamlet Center Plan, (1) acquisition of
certain land as the site of a public road bed extending easterly from the
intersection of the New Street and Oerter Place rights-of-way to Rockland
Lake Road, in said Town, at an estimated maximum cost of $83, 800, appro-
priating said amount therefor and authorizing the issuance of $4, 190 capital
notes to provide the down payment and $79, 610 serial bonds to finance the
balance of said appropriation, and (2) reconstruction and realignment of
Rockland Lake Road along said New Street right-of-way and said site at an
estimated maximum cost of $81, 130 and authorizing the issuance of $4, 080
capital notes to provide the down payment and $77, 050 serial bonds to
finance the balance of said appropriation and stating the estimated total
cost of acquiring said land and reconstructing and realigning said Road is
$164, 930, "
duly adopted and amended by the Town Board on the dates therein referred
to, $75, 000 serial bonds shall be issued, being part of the $77, 375 unre-
deemed balance of said bonds, bond anticipation notes in the principal amount ' ’
of $79, 610 having been heretofore issued in anticipation of the sale of said
bonds and redemption thereof provided therefor to the extent of $2, 235 from
a source other than the proceeds of said bonds, and shall mature in the prin-
cipal amount of $2, 500 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 to 1989, inclu-
sive,and $3, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1990 to 1999, inclusive.

Section 32. Said $191, 000 bonds, said $420, 000 bonds, said
$1, 320, 000 bonds, said $352, 000 bonds, said $764, 000 bonds, said $980, 000
bonds, said $468, 000 bonds, said $145, 000 bonds, said $770, 000 bonds, said
$744, 000 bonds, said $535, 000 bonds, said $510, 000 bonds, said $171, 000
bonds, said $230, 000'bonds, said $156, 000 bonds, said $476, 000 bonds,
said $1, 042, 000 bonds, said $308, 000 bonds, said $530, 000 bonds, said
$897, 000 bonds, said $68, 500 bonds, said $129, 500 bonds, said $78, 000

bonds, said $415, 000 bonds, said $85, 000 bonds, said $160, 000 bonds,



said $110, 060 bonds, said 8237,.000 bonds, said $208, 000 bonds, said
$85, 000 bonds and said $75, 000 bonds hereinabove described and referred
to in Sections 1 to 31, respectively, hereof shall be combined, for the
purpose of sale, into a single issue of serial bonds in the aggregate prin-
cipal amount of $12, 670, 000 and each of said bonds shall be designated
"VARIOUS SEWER DISTRICTS AND GENERAL PURPOSES SERIAL BOND-
1971." |

Said bonds shall b'e dated February 1, 1971 and shall mature in the
principal gmount of $350, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1972 and
1973, $355, 000 on February 1, 1974, $365, 000 on February 1, 1975,
$37$, 000 on February 1, 1976, $380, 000 on February 1, 1977, $390, 000
on February 1, 1978, $395,000 on February 1, 1979, $400, 000 on February
1, 1980, $405, 000 on February 1, 1981, $375, 000 on February 1, 1982,
$370, 000 on February 1, 1983, $350, 000 on February 1, 1984, $330, 000 on
February 1, 1985, $340, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1986 to
1988, inclusive, $345, 000 on February 1 in each of the years 1989 and
1990, $350, 000 on February 1, 1991, $355, 000 on February 1, 1992,
$360, 000 on February 1, 1993, $340, 000 on February 1 in each of the
years 1994 and 1995, $350, 000 on February 1, 1996, $340, 000 on February
1, 1997, $325, 000 on February 1, 1998, $320, 000 on February 1 in each of
the years 1999 to 2002, inclusive, $325, 000 on February 1, 2003, $320, 000
on February 1 in each of the years 2004 to 2006, inclusive, $280, 000 on
February 1, 2007 and $165, 000 on February 1, 2008;

Said bonds shall be of the denomination of $5, 000 each, shall be
2, 534 in number, shall be numbered in order of maturities from 1 to 2, 534,
inclusive, shall bear interest at a rate per annum necessary for the Town
to sell said bonds, the bidder to name the rate of interest in a multiple of

1/4 or 1/10 of 1%, the exact rate to be determined by the Supervisor of thé
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Town upon the receipt of bids therefor and confirmed by rgsolution of the
Town Board, as herecinafter set forth, payable August 1, 1971 and semi-
annually thereafter on the first days of February and August in each year
until maturity.

Both principal of and interest on said bonds shall be payable in
lawful money of the United States of America, at the principal office of
the First National City Bank, in the City, County and State of New York.

Said bonds shall be coupon in form, registerable at the option of
the holder as to both principal and interest at the office of the Registra-
tion Agent designated by the Town Board pursuant to the Local Finance
Law, shall be executed in the name of the Town by its Supervisor, shall
have the corporate seal of the Town affixed thereto and attested by its
Town Clerk, aﬁd shall have the coupons attached to said bonds authenti-
cated by the facsimile signature of its Supervisor.

Section 33. Said bonds shall be in substantially the following form: l
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Page 9
(1971-146) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

(INSERT RSSOLUTION DETERMINING THE TERMS, FORM AND DETAILS OF ISSUANCE OF
12,670,000 VARIOUS SEWER DISTRICTS AND GENERAL PURPOSES SERIAL BCHDS-1971

OF THE TOWN OF CLARKSTOWN, in the COUNTY OF ROCKLAND, NEW YORK, AND PROVIDING
FOR THEIR SALE) :

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.

(1971-1L7) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resoiution:

RESOLVED, that resolution #116 adopted 2/17/71 is hereby
rescinded, and be it

FURTHER RESOLVED, that Orange & Rockland Utilities, Inc.
is hereby authorized to install, in accordance with their revised proposal,
eleven (11) street lights; two on Deerfoof Lane, one on James St., two on
North Main 3t., one on Route 304, one each omn Short Hill Road, West Burda Lane,
West Germonds Road, West Nyack Rd., and one on Woodglen Drive; at total annual
cost to the town of $953.04,

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

Letter received from Theodore E. Zollendeck, Town Planner re
Felicia Estates (8AS) - Disposition of Parkland. Town Clerk will forward
copy of same to members of the Town Board.

Letter received from New York State Department of Transportation
re Intersectionasl Signs on Route 59, Eastbound in advance of Rose Road in
the vicinity of the Sheraton Motor Inn. Town Clerk requested to forward copy
of same to Town Attorney and Supervisor.
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(1971-148) Councilman Bolander offered tne following resolution:

RESOLVED, that James Summers, Highway Ave., Congers, New York
is hereby appointed to the position of Custodian of Wells Park, Congers, N Y
to commence on May 1, 1971 and terminate on October 31, 1971 at a salary of
%2.00 per hour.

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

(1971-149) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

WHEREAS, a proceeding has been instituted against the Town of
Clarkstown entitled as follows:

WARREN F. WARD, Petitioner
-against-

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS OF THE
TOWN OF CLARKSTOWN (W. REGINALD HERDMAN
CHAIRMAN)AND H & S PROPERTIES, Respondents

NOW THEREFORE, be it

RESOLVED, that the Town Attorney is hereby authorized to take
all necessary steps to defend said action.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.

(1971-150) Councilman Niehaus offered the followng resolution:

WHEREAS, a proceeding has been instituted against the Town of
Clarkstown entitled as follows:

JERRY HAGGERTY, KATHLEEN HAGGERTY,
ROBERT NORRIS, MARGARET NORRIS, Petitioners,

-against-

W. REGINALD HERDMAN, RIHARD BURLEIGH,
NICHAOLAS AMODEO, ROBERT LEVITAN, and

THOMAS P. COLLINS, constituting the ZONING
BOARD OF APPEALS OF THE TOWN OF CLARKSTOWN
and ROBERT BOWMAN, BUILDING INSPECTCR OF THE
TOWN OF CLARKSTOWN, Respondents

NOW THEREFORE, be it

{cont)
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(1971-159 - cont)

RESOLVED, that the Town Attorney is hereby authorized to
take all necessary steps to defend said action.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander. ’ All voted Aye.

(1971-151) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that resignation of Jo:ce Lynch Tigue from the
position of Secretary P/T in the Parks Board and Recreation Commission
is hereby accepted by the Town Board with regret.

Seconded by Councilman D*Antoni. All voted Aye.

(1971-152) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:
RESOLVED, that Mary Murray, 3 Adele Road, West Nyack N Y, is

hereby apnointed secretary to the Clarkstown Recreation Commission, at the

anaual salary of $808.50; appointment to take effrct immadiately.

Seconded by Councilman Bolander.

On roll call the vote was a3z follows:

AYES: Councilmen Bolander, D*Antoni, Supervisor Vines
ABSTENTION: Councilman Niehaus.

MOTION CARRIED

(1971-153%) Councilman D'Antoni offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Highway Superintendent is hereby authorized
to advertise for bids for Obsolete Highway Department Equipment; said bids to
pe returnable 4/7/71 - 8:20 PM.

Seconded by Councilman Niehaus. All voted Aye.
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(1971-154) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Supervisor be authorized to execute the
necessary Civil Service form for the Second Provisional appointment, pending
examination, of THOMAS BIERDS, 58 North Conger Avenue, Congers, New York, to
the position of Pymp Station Operator ~ Sewer Cepartment, at a salary of
$10,530.00 per annum; effective and retroactive to March lst, 1971.

Seconded by Councilman D'Antoni. All voted Aye.

Councilman Bolander concurred with the above resolution
prov1d1ng that this is the last provisional appointment.

(1971-155) Councilman Niehaus offered the following resolution:

RESOLVED, that Sgt. John F. Hearne is hereby authorized to
attend Police Supervision School, a State Mandated Program, at Westchester
Community College, Valhalla, New York, from 3/15 to 3/26/71, as recommended
by Clarkstown Police Chief Ernest Wiebicke, all expenses to be made a proper
town charge.

Scconded by Councilman Bolander. 211 voted Aye.

. Martin Bernstein, New City, appeared before the Town Board
suggesting that if the re-assessment program is not bompleted before B
the Tax Map is filed, that people who have homes built in the past five years
do something about organizing some tax protest.

On resolution offered by Councilman Niehaus, seconded by
Councilman Bolander, and unanimously adopted, Town Board meeting was
adjourned until Wednesday, March 10, 1971 at 8:00 PM, at which time
regularly scheduled public hearings will be held at the Town Board meeting

Anne E. O'Connor
Town Clerk




